
Item # Bid Item(s) Description
Estimated 

Annual Qty UOM Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Estimated 

Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price
Estimated 

Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

1 Chlorine (Ton Cylinders) 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 

2 Chlorine (150 lb. Cylinders) 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 

3

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 
(Sample testing required) 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT $213.85 $10,692.50 

4

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 
w/2% Copper Sulfate 
(Sample testing required) 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT $279.59 $139,795.00 

5 Aluminum Chlorohydrate 69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT $920.00 $63,480.00 69  DT $1,200.00 $82,800.00 

6 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 23% 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 

7

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 
with 2% Copper Sulfate 
(Sample testing required) 108000  Lbs No  Bid 108000  Lbs No  Bid 108000  Lbs $0.66 $71,064.00 

8
Sodium Permanganate 20%, 
tote 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 

9

Belt Press Polymer, 55 
Gallon Drums (Sample 
testing required) 550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal No Bid

10
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 
(LAS) 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal $0.93 $43,374.72 

11

Sodium Permanganate 20%, 
tote 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 

Total:  NO BID

BID OPENING:   09/08/16

BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER:  16-013 

WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

VENDOR

KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS, INC.

Total:  $347,726.22Total:  $63,480.00

VENDORVENDOR

NAPCO CHEMICAL COMPANY CHAMELEON INDUSTRIES, INC.



Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 

250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 

50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 

500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 

69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT $1,112.00 $76,728.00 69  DT  No  Bid 

40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton $487.00  $       19,480.00 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 

108000  Lbs No  Bid 108000  Lbs No  Bid 108000  Lbs No  Bid 108000  Lbs No  Bid 

25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs $0.84 $21,385.35 

550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal No Bid

46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 

3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 

VENDOR

POLYDINE, INC.

Total:  NO BID Total:  $19,840.00 Total:  $76,728.0 Total:  $21,385.35

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

MOSAIC GLOBAL SALES, LLC
WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS dba SUMMIT 
CHEMICAL SPECIALTY PRODUCTS SHANNON CHEMICAL CORPORATION



Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton $648.00 $97,200.00 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 

250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 

50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT 214.00 10,700.00 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 

500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT 273.24 136,620.00 500  DT $440.00 $22,000.00 500  DT  No  Bid 

69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT 908.00 62,652.00 69  DT No Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 

40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton $728.00 $50,232.00 40  Ton  No  Bid 

108000  Lbs $0.60  $         64,800.00 108000  Lbs $0.5980 $64,584.00 108000  Lbs  No  Bid 108000  Lbs $0.82 $88,560.00 

25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs $0.94 $23,970.00 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs No Bid

550  Gal 
$9.277/ 
$9.88

$4,638.50/  
$5,434.00 550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal  No  Bid 550  Gal $13.50 $7,425.00 

46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal $0.90 $41,760.00 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 

3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal $1.59 $4,809.75 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 

 NOTE:  
LINE 

ITEM #9 
 PRICE #1 = 
FACTORY 

 PRICE #2 = 
TEXAS  

 WAREHOUSE 

Total:  $69,438.50 - $70,234.00

VENDOR

Total:  $422,295.75

VENDOR

FORT BEND SERVICES, INC. BRENNTAG SOUTHWEST, INC.

Total:  $72,232.00 Total:  $95,985.00

VENDOR VENDOR

GEO SPECIALTY CHEMICALS CARUS CORPORATION



Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  $        695.00  $         104,250.00 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 

250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  $          87.75  $           21,937.50 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 

50  DT $216.00 $10,800.00 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 

500  DT $392.53 $196,265.00 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 

69  DT $764.00 $52,716.00 69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 

40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton $485.00 $19,400.00 40  Ton  No  Bid 

108000  Lbs  No  Bid 108000  Lbs  No  Bid 108000  Lbs  No  Bid 108000  Lbs  No  Bid 

25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs $0.96 $24,378.00 

550  Gal  No  Bid 550  Gal  No  Bid 550  Gal  No  Bid 550  Gal  No  Bid 

46400  Gal $0.0880 $40,832.00 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 

3025  Gal No No Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 

Total:  $300,613.00

VENDOR VENDOR

Total:  $126,187.50 Total:  $19,400.00

VENDOR

DPC INDUSTRIES, INC. PENNCO, INC.CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US, LLC

Total:  $24,378.00

VENDOR

CHEMRITE, INC.



Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Annual Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price

150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 150  Ton  No  Bid 

250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 250  Ea  No  Bid 

50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 50  DT  No  Bid 

500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 500  DT  No  Bid 

69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 69  DT  No  Bid 

40  Ton $875.00 $35,000.00 40  Ton  No  Bid 40  Ton  No  Bid 

108000  Lbs No Bid 108000  Lbs $0.75 $81,000.00 108000  Lbs No Bid

25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 25500  Lbs  No  Bid 

550  Gal No Bid 550  Gal $10.25 $5,637.50 550  Gal No Bid

46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 46400  Gal  No  Bid 

3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 3025  Gal  No  Bid 

VENDOR VENDOR

Total:  $35,000.00

VENDOR

WHOLESALE CHEMICAL

Total:  $86,637.50
UNIVAR STERLING WATER TECHNOLOGIES, LLC

Total:  NO BID
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