CoRR IFB BID TABULATION

VENDOR

VENDOR

IFB NUMBER: 15-035

BID OPENING: September 15, 2015 @ 3:00 pm

DU Construction, Inc.

Pathmark Traffic Products

. i . Total: Total:
Pavement Marking, Curb Painting Services and ot ot
Related Products S 382,600.00 | S 51,200.00
Item Estimated

# |Bid Item(s) Description Annual Qty | UOM | Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

TYPE 1 - Thermoplastic Reflectorized

Pavement Marking Application No Bid
1 |Machine Application 325,000 | LF |$ 0.36 | $117,000.00

TYPE 1 - Thermoplastic Reflectorized

Pavement Marking Application No Bid
2 |Hand Application 80,000 LF | S 1.05| $ 84,000.00

TYPE 1 - Thermoplastic Reflectorized

Pavement Lettering No Bid
3 |Hand Application 100 EA|S 110.00 | S 11,000.00

TYPE 1 - Thermoplastic Reflectorized

Pavement Shapes No Bid
4 |Hand Application 400 EA S 30.00 | $ 12,000.00

TYPE 1 - Thermoplastic Reflectorized

Pavement Symbols No Bid
5 |Hand Application 400 EA|S 128.00 | S 51,200.00

TYPE 2 - Palnt.Pav'ement Marking No Bid
6 |Machine Application 25000 | LF [$ 0.23|$ 5,750.00

TYPE 2 - Pa‘lnt I?avement Marking No Bid
7 |Hand Application 5000 | LF|$ 070 $ 3,500.00

TYPE 2 - Pallnt I?avement Lettering No Bid
g |Hand Application 100 | EA|$ 35.00 | $ 3,500.00

TYPE 2 - Pa‘lnt I?avement Shapes No Bid
g |Hand Application 400 | EA|$ 15.00 | $ 6,000.00

TYPE 2 - Pallnt I?avement Symbols No Bid
10 |Hand Application 400 | EA|$ 40.00 | $ 16,000.00

Marking Elimination No Bid
11 30,000 | LF |$ 0.50 | $ 15,000.00

Raised Pavement Markers No Bid
12 1,000 EA | S 415(S 4,150.00

Curb Painting

(Lettering includes Fire Lanes, No No Bid
13 |Parking, etc.) 5,000 LF | S 0.70| $ 3,500.00

Bulk Thermoplastic Reflectorized
14 |Yellow 20 | Ton| $1,250.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 25,600.00

Bulk Thermoplastic Reflectorized
15 |White 20 | TON|$1,250.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $1,280.00 | $ 25,600.00
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